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Tel: +1 860 482 2800, Fax: +1 860 482 2872 

FCT Electronics has expanded its D-Sub 
Accessory product offering with the intro-
duction of new Single Piece Spring Latches.  
These can be front panel mounted allowing 
D-Sub Connectors to be rear mounted. 
 
No sex distinction or specific orientation is 
required as the cut out is of sufficient size 
and fully symmetrical so reducing the possi-
bility of installation errors.  Mating orienta-
tion is accomplished by the D-Sub’s own 
trapezoid features. 
 
The parts thumb spring also possesses an 
angled feature to facilitate reduced oppor-
tunity for mating interference when closed.  
FCT’s product is fully RoHS Compliant.  All 
materials are Steel and the standard finish 
is Passivated. 
 
FCT Electronics, is a leading manufacturer 
of D-Sub Connectors and Accessories for 
Major Communications Infrastructure and 
Industrial applications.   
 
Most recently, FCT’s high quality products 
and extensive development capability have 
brought the company in to the Aerospace 
market and this product introduction is just 
one of the companies initiatives to support 
the specific needs of customer applications. 
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Latch 

Lock Plate 

1 A1277-1000 F65M032E000+S 

2 A1277-2000 F65M032E000+S 

3 A1277-3000 F65M032E000+S 

4 A1277-4000 F65M032E000+S 

5 A1277-5000 F65M130E000+S 

Size 3 Example 

Lock Plate 
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